STATE MINISTRY OF PROVINCIAL COUNCILS & LOCAL
GOVERNMENT AFFAIRS

GREATER COLOMBO WATER AND WASTEWATER MANAGEMENT
IMPROVEMENT INVESTMENT PROGRAMME (GCWWMIIP)

CONDITION ASSESSMENT AND URGENT REPAIRS OF SEWERS - LOT A - 89
KILOMETERS OF GRAVITY SEWERS WITH CCTV AND LOT B - 8.2 KM OF FORCE
MAINS WITH SPECIAL DEVICE (SD) WITHIN THE COLOMBO MUNICIPAL

COUNCIL AREA

ICB CONTRACT NO: GCWWMIIP-P2/ADB/RQ/DSIDC/ICB-01/2019
Notification of Award

As per provisions of Instructions to Bidders (ITB) Sub-clause 39.2 of the relevant Bidding Documents.
we wish to kindly inform the results of the bidding. along with the following information pertaining to the

bidding.

(i) Name of Bidders and (ii) Bid prices as read out at bid opening

Bid Prices as Read Out at Bid opening

Cortporation

Discount 8%

Bidder’s Name (LKR)
LOT (A) LOT (B) LOT (A+B)
Teacly(s) Ple Ltd 885.658,912.50 421,076,990.40 | 1,248,399,850.50
China Geo- Engineering 1,271.513,837.13 | 400,354,530.62 1,674.800,759.63

Discount 8%

Discount 8%

SoilTech — Beijing Yanggi JV

931,538.102.00
Discount 7%

No bid submitted

1,206,126,168.50
Discount 10
million

Ludwig Pfeiffer

1.097.738.247.44

No bid submitted

No bid submitted

(iii) Name and evaluated prices of each Bid that were evaluated

Bidder’s Name

Evaluated Bid Prices (LKR)

LOT (A)

LOT (B)

LOT (A+B)

Teacly(s) Pte 1.td

805.144.465.00

382.797.264.00

1.134.908.955.00

Corporation

China Geo- Engineering

1.064.903,431.00

334, 841.971.00

1,402,197.947.00

Ludwig Peiffer

997.943,861.00

No Bid

No Bid

Comparison of Lowest Evaluated Bids for cach Lots as per Clause 1.6 of Section 3 — Evaluation and
Qualification Criteria — Volume I of the bidding document. (IFinancial figures in column (1), (2) & (4)
below are extracted from table under part (iii} ahove)

Column No (1) 2) B)=1)+(2) )
LOT (A)+ LOT LOT (A)y+ LOT
LOT (A) LOT (B) (B) awarded (B) combined
separately offer
Lowest Teacly(s) Pt China Geo- “d('(l);l(s) P(E?‘L_td &
Evaluated Ldbly d ¢ Engineering ”.m\ JfO Teacly(s) Pte Ltd
Bidder & Corporation I’;‘ngmccx ne
Corporation
Lowest
Evaluated Bid
Amount LKR 805.144.465 334.841.971 1,139,986,436 1,134,908,955
Excluding 10%
contlingencies
and VAT
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As per the detail evaluation shown above, bid submitted by Teacly(s) Pte Ltd for combined Lot A + Lot
B is the feast cost combination for the Employer, rather than awarding Lot A and Lot B to the lowest
evaluated bidders for Lot A and Lot B separately.

(iv) Name of bidder whose bid was rejected and reasons for rejection

Bidder’s Name Reasons for Rejection
LOT (A)

Non-Compliance of Experience requirement.
Non-Compliance of Time for Completion.

LOT (B)

No bid submitted

LOT (A) + (B)

Non-Compliance of Time for Completion.

SoilTech — Beijing
Yangqi JV

(v) Name of winning Bidder and the price it offered and duration and summary of scope of the
contract awarded.

Accepted
Offered Contract Contract Amount
Amount (LKR) (LKR) Duration and
Bidder’s Name (Including 10% (Including 10% Summary of Scope
contingencies & contingencies & of Contract
excluding VAT) excluding VAT)
Duration for Lot (A)
- 595 days
Duration for Lot (B)
Teacly(s) Pte Ltd, — 252 days.
No.03.
Sungei Kadut Drive 1,248.399,850.50 1,248,399,850.50 Scope of Contract
Singapore [729556]. remaing same for
both Lots as that
given in the Bidding
Document

Secretary

State Ministry of Provincial Councils & Local Government Affairs
No. 330, Union Place

Colombo — 02

Telephone: 011-23997335; fax: 011- 2329725

Email: secretary@pelg.gov.lk

{r10.2021
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